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that I've thought about. 1) Right before I left for work today the tech of my building got on the phone to me
and asked if I could come by the office. We talked about the ice storm and then he asks me, "do you like
boys?" I just looked at him and said, "well, yeah, why?" I didn't want to be rude, but I was kinda curious. He
then says, "well, because I just want to ask you a couple of questions." So we walked to his office and he asks
me how I found out I was gay and I told him I found it on a website called, "gay sex stories" haha, but he just
laughed and kinda said, "yeah, that's not really the answer I was looking for." I just looked at him kinda
confused. We then started talking and he asked me about my experiences with boys, and I basically told him
everything. He asked me about my ex and what he was like, and how good he was at sex. Then he asked me
about my ex. He said, "was he a good lover?" And I told him yes, he was great, but I think my ex forgot about
how I like sex. Then he asked me if I had gotten any on my ex, and I told him yes, but I don't think my ex
even knew. Then we got back to the sex. He asked me if I have gotten any on myself, and I told him no,
because I'm really scared to. I don't want to get gay herpes from the boys I've had sex with, and if they do
have it they won't tell me. Then he asked me if I would be interested in being his submissive, and I said yes.
He kind of got this look on his face and
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barriers and attitudes in Québec]. The purpose of this study was to identify the factors preventing women
from seeking abortion care. Two hundred randomly selected women on the waiting list for the Montréal
Women's Hospital (MWH) were interviewed by telephone. A woman in waiting between the 11th and 13th
week of pregnancy. Only 27 (13%) knew of the existence of a clinic near their home. The vast majority were
afraid of what they would hear (91%), didn't know that an abortion is legal (79%) and felt fear and anxiety
(69%). Many were accustomed to consulting a spiritual advisor. The abortion rate is equal for women from
immigrant and non-immigrant backgrounds and the main reason for the poor access to abortion care is
language barrier. A proper assessment of the consequences of an unwanted pregnancy for these women is
important for the improvement of health information aimed at this population.Q: How to connect to
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